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1. Overview

A Vendor of Record (VoR) is a procurement arrangement that has been established through a
competitive process. The arrangement authorizes one or more qualified vendors to provide
goods/services to TRCA for a defined period of time and in accordance with terms and
conditions, including pricing, as set out in the VOR agreement.

This VoR allows TRCA staff to select from a list of pre-qualified vendors for the rental of
construction equipment for a value of less than $75,000 per project.

2. Contact Information

Company Name Address Phone Email
Cooper 6335 Edwards
Eglrj];grll;ent Ryan Elbers I?Ali\;(l’issauga, 416-389-9859 | relbers@cooperequipment.ca
L5T-2W7
Sunbelt 12 Leslie St,
Rentals Steve Soares | Toronto, M4M- 416-579-6142 | steve.soares@sunbeltrentals.com
Canada 3H7
_ Andrew 11 Mars Rd,
United Rentals Etobicoke, MOV- | 416-524-7356 | ahennessy@ur.com
Hennessy 2K2
Hertz 6900 Finch Ave
Equipment Paul Dillon W, Toronto, 416-660-8374 | Paul.dillon@hercrentals.com
Rentals MOW-0A8
Battlefield 240 Bradwick
Equipment Toli Taris Dr, Concord, 416-433-5551 | toil.taris@toromont.com
Rentals L4K-1K8

3. Creating Purchase Orders (PO)

When renting equipment, staff is required to create a Child PO from RO #10007626, in the
Procurement and Agreement Database. In the appropriate Procurement, click on 'POs' at the

top of the screen, then select 'Create Child PO (VOR). The PO database will open. Select the
desired supplier from the Vendor list, and complete/submit the PO as normal. The master PO#
is R-M-JS-00472.



Vendor of Record (VOR) Procedures

The use of this VOR is mandatory. Periodic checks by the Finance (Procurement)
department will be conducted to ensure the VOR is being utilized to its full potential.

The Vendors of Record (VOR) list is valid from August 1, 2018 to July 31, 2019.

The VoR list is to be used for supply and delivery requests totaling less than $75,000
(excluding HST) per project. Supply and delivery requests above this threshold must be
processed through a competitive procurement process, applied through the
Procurements and Agreements database.

Refer to Schedule A for unit pricing. Vendors are to be contacted on a project basis
based on the lowest total price for the equipment needed and if the equipment is not
available then contact the next company that has the lowest price. TRCA staff are to
provide a one (1) day notice for daily rental, and two (2) day notice for weekly or monthly
rentals. In the event that none of the suppliers are able to fulfill the request, staff will be
required to conduct an RFQ process for the specific material and create a separate
Purchase Order.

All Correspondence and requests must be submitted to the vendor via email (in writing)
to the provided contact person in Section 2.

All deliveries must be accompanied by substantiating documentation such as receipts,
delivery receipts, and any other documentation requested by TRCA for verification of
cost. HAND WRITTEN DOCUMENTATION WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

Prior to the commencement of any work, staff must ensure that insurance and WSIB
certificates are up to date, including valid Form 1000. Insurance and WSIB certificates
must be attached to all Payment Requisitions for processing of final payment.

Staff must use appropriate GL codes when processing invoices (GL 331).

Vendor of Record Agreements for each of the vendors can be found in the Procurement
and Agreement Database under contract #10007626.

Staff may also attach any documentation supporting evaluation of the vendor’s
performance to the Payment Requisition.

Responsibilities

Staff are responsible for ensuring that up to date insurance and WSIB certificates are
attached to each Payment Requisition.

Construction Services Staff within the Engineering Projects group will maintain all VOR
agreements.



Construction Services Staff within the Engineering Projects will maintain the VOR list
contact information and update the procedures as needed.

Staff calling upon the VOR list are responsible for following the above procedures and
processing all invoices related to each request.

For questions related to the VOR for Rental of Construction Equipment please contact:
Ron Ofer at rofer@trca.on.ca, ext. 5614



Schedule ‘A’
Schedule of Rates 2018-2019

EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES
Cooper Equipment Battlefield Equipment United Rentals Sunbelt Rentals Hertz Equig
AIR COMPRESSOR DAILY | WEEKLY | 4WEEKS | DAILY [ WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
185 CFM $ 57.00] $ 198.00 [ $ 570.00|$ 80.00|$ 280.00[$ 650.00 [ $ 116.00 | $ 296.00 [$ 697.00| $ 75.00[$ 20000 |$ 52500 8500 $ 20500|$ 524.00
1,600 CFM $ 510.00 | $2,010.00 | $5,520.00 | $ 948.00 | $3,305.60 | $ 9,352.80 | $1,594.00 | $3,501.00 | $ 9,648.00 | $1,230.00 | $3,380.00 | $10,400.00 | $ 535.00 | $2,700.00 | $ 6,700.00
COMPACTION EQUIPMENT DAILY | weekLy [4weeks | pAiLy | weekLy [ aweeks | paiLy [ weekiy [ 4aweeks | paiLy [ weekLy | aweeks | pAaiy | weekLy | 4 weeks
HAND EQUIPMENT
Hand Tamper NOBID | NOBID | NOBID [$ 2500]$ 5000]$ 7500 NOBID | NOBID NOBID [$ 1000[$ 2500]$ 10000[$ 1500[$ 30.00[$  45.00
Jumping Jack $ 2280 3% 9120 $ 25080 |$ 40.00|$ 140.00[$ 350.00 [ $ 32.00[ $ 102.00[$ 29500 $ 2500[$ 95.00]$ 27500 $ 5348 $ 14976 |$ 40221
15 - 20" Plate Compactor $ 2640 $ 10560 | $ 306.00|$ 4000 |$ 140.00[$ 35000 $ 70.00|$ 269.00|$ 777.00| $ 2500[$ 10000]$ 30000 | $ 5028 $ 13264|% 363.70
28" Reversible Plate Compactor $ 108.00 | $ 348.00 | $1,082.00 [ $ 130.00 | $ 425.00[$ 850.00[ $ 81.00[ $ 321.00[$ 911.00[ $ 7500 [$ 300.00]$ 87500 $ 127.00| $ 33054 [$ 937.05
WALK BEHIND VIBRATORY ROLLERS
25" - 30" Double Drum Roller [$ 5520]$ 22080[$ 661.20[$ 106.00]$ 366003 966.00] $ 229.00] $ 612.00[$ 168400 $ 8500[$ 340.00[$ 1,000.00] NOoBD | NOBD | NOBID
36" Double Drum Roller | noBD | NnoBD | NnoBID [$ 142.00[$ 491.00[$ 1,295.00] $ 107.00 [ $ 337.00|$ 991.00] $ 140.00] $ 550.00 [ $ 1,500.00 | $ 324.10 | $ 550.89 | $ 1,487.95
RIDE-ON VIBRATORY ROLLERS
48" padfoot/smooth drum $ 186.00 | $ 636.00 | $1,740.00 [ $ 235.00 | $ 815.00 [ $ 2,050.00 [ $ 204.00 [ $ 714.00 [$ 1,938.00 | $ 160.00 [ $ 640.00 [$ 1,900.00] NoBID | NOBID NO BID
56" padfoot/smooth drum $ 321.60 | $1,114.20 | $2,982.60 | $ 295.00 | $1,020.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 714.00 [ $ 1,938.00| $ 17000 [ $ 775.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 344.40 | $1,063.28 | $ 2,534.11
66" padfoot/smooth drum $ 135.00 | $ 468.00 | $1,252.80 | $ 360.00 | $1,245.00 [ $ 3,000.00 [ $ 256.00 | $1,020.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | $ 235.00 [ $ 950.00 | $ 2,800.00 [ $ 372.00 | $1,199.00 [ $ 2,650.00
84" padfoot/smooth drum $ 364.20 | $1,328.40 | $3,600.00 | $ 455.00 | $1,575.00 [ $ 3,600.00 | $ 306.00 | $1,224.00 | $ 3,264.00 | $ 300.00 [ $1,200.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 375.00 | $1,150.00 | $ 3,428.00
CONCRETE & MASNORY EQUIPMENT DAILY | WEEKLY | 4WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4WEEKS | DAILY | WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
12" gas powered Concrete Saw $ 2460|$ 8760 $ 21840 |$ 4000 |$ 140.00[$ 275.00[$ 26.00|$ 97.00[$ 28400 $ 25.00[$ 10000 |$ 30000 [$ 47.07|$ 121.95|$ 363.70
14" gas powered Concrete Saw $ 2760 % 9420|$ 23580 |$ 4000 |$ 140.00[$ 27500 $ 32.00|$ 11200 |$ 32100 $ 2800 $ 11000 |$ 29000 | $ 5242 | $ 181.85| % 48564
115 V, hand held Coring Drill $ 69.00] $ 27600 $ 777.00|$ 7200 |$ 280.00[$ 720.00[$ 72.00[$ 14000 [$ 34400 $ 50.00[$ 17500 ]$ 550.00 [ $ 138.00 | $ 386.16 | $ 1,091.09
2 - 3 1%, electric, Concrete Masonry Mixer $ 3060|% 12240 | $ 27600|$ 4480 |$ 17040[$ 48000 $ 5000]$ 14800|$ 28800 $ 2500[$ 9500]$ 27500 $ 4000 $ 13400|$ 332.00
4 - 6 ft°, gas, Concrete Masonry Mixer $ 5520| % 22080 % 65520 % 7120|$ 26320[$ 73760[$ 73.00[$ 21800[$ 43600 $ 5000[$ 19500 57500 $ 6739 $ 16580 42467
EARTH MOVING EQUIPMENT DAILY | weekLY [4aweeks [ DALY [ weekLy | aweeks | paiy | weekLy | aweeks | DALy [ weekLy | 4weeks | DALY [ WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
BACKHOES
1. Rubber Tire Backhoe 14-15' ['$ 300.00[ $1,114.20 [ $2,957.40 [ $ 300.00 [ $1,200.00 [ $ 3,000.00 [ $ 281.00 [ $ 995.00 [ $ 2,341.00] $ 230.00 [ $ 920.00 | $ 2,750.00 [ $ 285.00 | $ 775.00 | $ 2,300.00
1. Wheel Loader 2.00 - 2.50 CUYD $ 407.40 | $1,200.00 | $3,557.40 [ $ 440.00 | $1,680.00 [ $ 4,320.00 [ $ 485.00 | $1,530.00 [ $ 3,672.00] NOBID [ NOBID NOBID [ $ 456.00 | $1,440.00 | $ 3,680.00
2. Wheel Loader 2.50 - 3.00 CUYD $ 578.40 | $1,928.40 | $5,100.00 | $ 491.00 | $1,963.00 [ $ 5,890.00 | $ 535.00 | $1,729.00 | $ 3,978.00 | $ 450.00 [ $1,900.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 456.00 | $1,440.00 | $ 3,680.00
3. Wheel Loader 3.25 - 3.50 CUYD $ 621.60 | $2,100.00 | $5,485.80 | $ 546.00 | $2,185.00 [ $ 6,555.00 | $ 587.00 | $1,990.00 [ $ 4,692.00 | NOBID | NO BID NOBID [ $ 456.00 | $1,440.00 | $ 3,680.00
4. Wheel Loader 3.50 - 4.00 CUYD $ 621.60 | $2,100.00 | $5,485.80 | $ 546.00 | $2,185.00 | $ 6,555.00 | $ 800.00 | $2,473.00 | $ 6,700.00 | NOBID | NO BID NOBID | $ 652.00 | $1,876.00 | $ 6,040.00
BACKHOE/LOADER ATTACHMENTS, QUICK CONNECT
Forks $ 4560 $ 180.00 | $ 36420 $ 50.00 |$ 200.00[$ 500.00[$ 33.00[$ 101.00[$ 15000 $ 3000[$ 75.00]$ 20000[$ 3400]$ 8000[$ 255.00
Hydraulic Broom $ 216.00 | $ 648.00 | $1,944.00 | $ 210.00 |$ 735.00[$ 1,950.00 | $ 97.00 | $ 505.00 [ $ 1,072.00 [ $ 210.00 | $ 840.00 | $ 2552000 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
Hoe-Pac NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |$ 193.60$ 716.00 |$ 202240 $ 63.00]$ 19500 [$ 390.00 $ 150.00| $ 600.00|$ 1,775.00] NOBID | NOBID NO BID
TRACKED DOZERS, 6 WAY BLADES
1. Tracked Dozer 70 HP - 80 HP $ 325.80 | $1,195.80 | $3,235.80 | $  392.80 | $1,466.40 | $ 4,148.80 | $ 418.00 | $1,670.00 [ $ 3,876.00 | $ 355.00 | $1,420.00 | $ 4,000.00 [ $ 618.30 | $1,542.50 [ $ 4,022.06
2. Tracked Dozer 80 HP - 90 HP $ 368.40 | $1,285.80 | $3,424.20 | $ 484.80 | $1,816.00 [ $ 5,134.40 | $ 403.00 | $1,428.00 | $ 3,363.00 | $ 440.00 [ $1,750.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 743.40 | $1,873.04 | $ 5,619.12
3. Tracked Dozer 90 HP - 110 HP, $ 428.40 | $1,500.00 | $3,942.60 | $ 550.40 | $2,059.20 | $ 5,823.20 | $1,117.00 | $3,264.00 | $ 6,478.00 | $ 525.00 | $1,950.00 | $ 5,650.00 | $ 743.40 | $1,873.04 | $ 5,619.12
4. Tracked Dozer 130 HP $ 557.40 | $1,928.40 | $5,100.00 | $ 567.00 | $2,267.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $1,117.00 | $3,264.00 | $ 6,478.00 | $ 500.00 | $1,985.00 | $ 5,950.00 | NOBID | NO BID NO BID
MINI EXCAVATORS
1. Tracked Mini Excavator 1-2 Ton $ 120.00 | $ 480.00 | $1,404.00 [ $ 160.00 | $ 600.00 [ $ 1,550.00 | $ 147.00 [ $ 562.00 [ $ 1,428.00| $ 135.00 [ $ 535.00 | $ 1,600.00 [ $ 241.80 | $ 496.34 [ $ 1,322.15
2. Tracked Mini Excavator 2-3 Ton $ 126.00 | $ 504.00 | $1,476.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 985.00 [$ 2,475.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 658.00 | $ 1,632.00 | $ 135.00 [ $ 535.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 168.00 | $ 486.00 | $ 1,441.00
3. Tracked Mini Excavator 3-4 Ton $ 198.00 | $ 774.00 | $2,274.00 [ $ 350.00 | $1,200.00 [ $ 3,200.00 [ $ 229.00 [ $ 749.00 [$ 1,780.00 | $ 170.00 [ $ 675.00 | $ 2,000.00 [ $ 415.00 | $ 771.25 [ $ 2,093.40
4. Tracked Mini Excavator 4-5 Ton $ 216.00 | $ 852.00 | $2,502.00 [ $ 375.00 | $1,315.00 [ $ 3,500.00 [ $ 271.00 [ $ 913.00 [ $ 2,244.00| $ 185.00 [ $ 700.00 | $ 2,150.00 | $ 483.50 | $1,152.06 | $ 2,974.83
5. Tracked Mini Excavator 5-6 Ton $ 234.00 | $ 930.00 | $2,724.00 | $ 375.00 | $1,315.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 271.00 | $ 913.00 | $ 2,244.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 483.50 | $1,152.06 | $ 2,974.83
6. Tracked Mini Excavator 6-7 Ton $ 366.00 | $1,380.00 | $3,828.00 | $ 443.20 | $1,660.80 [ $ 4,160.00 [ $ 331.00 | $1,224.00 [ $ 3,162.00 | $ 250.00 [ $ 910.00 | $ 2,700.00 [ $ 625.80 | $1,542.50 | $ 4,732.34
7. Tracked Mini Excavator 7-8 Ton $ 420.00 | $1,440.00 | $3,960.00 | $ 443.20 | $1,660.80 [ $ 4,160.00 | $ 331.00 | $1,224.00 | $ 3,162.00 | $ 280.00 | $1,120.00 | $ 3,350.00 | $ 625.80 | $1,542.50 | $ 4,732.34
8. Tracked Mini Excavator 8-9 Ton $ 420.00 | $1,440.00 | $3,960.00 | $ 443.20 | $1,660.80 [ $ 4,160.00 | $ 331.00 | $1,224.00 [ $ 3,162.00 | $ 280.00 [ $1,120.00 | $ 3,350.00 | $ 625.80 | $1,542.50 [ $ 4,732.34
MINI EXCAVATOR ATTACHMENTS
Auger $ 2160 $ 6420]$ 15000 |$ 12240 |$ 451.20[$ 1,274.40] $ 13500 $ 406.00[$ 81100 $ 7000 [ $ 27000 ]$ 800.00 [ $ 100.00 [ $ 275.00[$ 800.00
Thumb $ 2460 |$ 7380 $ 219.00|$ 4720 |$ 180.00 [ $  480.00 | $ = $ = $ = $ - $ - $ - $ 12520 [ $ 21501 | $ 578.71
Breaker $ 12900 | $ 465.00 | $1,164.00 | $ 4160 |$ 152.80 | $ 432.80 | $ 190.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 550.00 [ $ 1,650.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 1,100.00
Hoe-Pac $ 162.60 | $ 578.40 | $1,440.00 | $ 193.60 | $ 716.00 | $ 2,022.40 [ $ 63.00 | $ 195.00 [ $ 390.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,775.00] NOBID | NO BID NO BID
TRACKED EXCAVATORS
1. Tracked Excavator 13 Ton $ 742.95 | $2,553.85 | $6,964.10 [ $ 535.20 | $2,001.60 [ $ 5,280.00 | $ 460.00 | $1,530.00 [ $ 3,570.00 | $ 500.00 [ $2,000.00 | $ 4,780.00 [ $ 550.00 | $1,742.00 [ $ 4,690.00
2. Tracked Excavator 14 Ton $ 742.95 | $2,553.85 | $6,964.10 | $ 648.80 | $2,428.00 [ $ 6,200.00 | $ 460.00 | $1,530.00 | $ 3,570.00 | $ 625.00 [ $2,300.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 550.00 | $1,742.00 | $ 4,690.00
3. Tracked Excavator 16 Ton $ 863.85 | $2,832.05 | $7,567.95 | $  746.40 | $2,792.00 [ $ 6,800.00 [ $ 470.00 | $1,625.00 [ $ 4,896.00 | $ 475.00 | $1,885.00 | $ 5,650.00 | $ 550.00 | $1,742.00 [ $ 4,690.00
4. Tracked Excavator 20 Ton $ 863.85 | $2,832.05 | $7,567.95 | $ 567.00 | $2,267.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 489.00 | $1,734.00 | $ 4,896.00 | $ 625.00 | $2,500.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $1,438.00 | $3,635.90 | $ 9,034.66
5. Tracked Excavator 25 Ton $ 863.85 | $2,832.05 | $7,567.95 | $ 681.00 | $2,723.00 | $ 8,170.00 | $ 489.00 | $1,734.00 | $ 4,896.00 | $ 625.00 | $2,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $1,438.00 | $3,635.90 | $ 9,034.66




Schedule ‘A’

Schedule of Rates 2018-2019

EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES

Cooper Equipment

Battlefield Equipment

United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals

Hertz Equipment

EXCAVATOR ATTACHMENTS

Hoe-Pac $ 186.00 | $ 660.60 | $1,645.80 [ $ 167.00 |$ 667.00 [ $ 2,000.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 150.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,775.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Wrist-O-Twist Bucket $ 4560 |$ 180.00| $ 364.20($ 125.00|$ 500.00 |$ 1,500.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 300.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,700.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Thumb $ 4260 | $ 12840 | $ 300.00|$ 104.00 |$ 417.00|$ 1,250.00]|$ = $ = $ o $ - $ - $ - $ 12520 | $ 215.01|$ 578.71
Additional Bucket $ 4560 |$ 180.00| $ 36420($ 7100 |$ 283.00($ 850.00]|$ o $ S $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 11.00|$ 37.00($ 104.00
CRAWLER CARRIERS/TRACKED DUMPERS

1. Crawler Carrier 26" $ 192.00 | $ 708.00 | $2,082.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 203.00 | $ 454.00|$ 1,246.00( NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. Crawler Carrier 41" $ 240.00 | $ 966.00 [ $2,838.00 | $ 176.80 | $ 656.00 | $ 1,855.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 820.00 | $ 2,100.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Crawler Carrier 58" $ 240.00 | $ 966.00 | $2,838.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Crawler Carrier 94" $ 276.00 | $1,080.00 [ $3,180.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. Crawler Carrier 6 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. Crawler Carrier 9 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. Crawler Carrier 14 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRACKED SKID STEERS

1. Tracked Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 2700LB $ 270.00 | $1,032.00 | $3,030.00 [ $ 285.00 | $ 950.00 [ $ 2,800.00 | $ 276.00 [ $ 913.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 640.00 | $ 1,500.00 [ $ 289.00 | $ 720.00 [ $ 2,160.00
2. Tracked Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 3200LB $ 276.00 | $1,080.00 | $3,180.00 [ $ 375.00 | $1,315.00 [ $ 3,400.00 | $ 426.00 | $1,305.00 | $ 2,968.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 2,400.00 [ $ 400.00 | $1,150.00 [ $ 3,395.00
3. Tracked Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 3700LB $ 276.00 | $1,080.00 [ $3,180.00 | $ 400.00 | $1,475.00 | $ 4,100.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 250.00 | $1,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 506.00 | $1,508.00 | $ 4,315.00
WHEELED SKID STEERS

1. Wheeled Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 1350LB $ 138.00 | $ 492.00 | $1,440.00($ 185.00 |$ 675.00($ 1,350.00| $ 147.00 | $ 535.00 | $ 1,020.00| $ 110.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 1,350.00 [ $ 110.20 | $ 302.99 [ $ 908.97
2. Wheeled Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 1500LB $ 138.00 | $ 492.00 | $1,440.00($ 185.00 |$ 675.00($ 1,350.00| $ 154.00 | $ 562.00 | $ 1,122.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 1,400.00 [ $ 250.00 | $ 637.00 [ $ 1,776.00
3. Wheeled Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 1750LB $ 150.00 | $ 540.00 | $1,590.00 [ $ 195.00 |$ 750.00 ($ 1,500.00 | $ 154.00 | $ 562.00 | $ 1,122.00| $ 125.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,500.00 [ $ 268.50 | $ 578.71 | $ 1,432.32
4. Wheeled Skid Steer (Min. Lifting Capacity) 2000LB $ 150.00 | $ 540.00 [ $1,590.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 159.00 | $ 612.00 | $ 1,326.00| $ 160.00 | $ 640.00 | $ 1,900.00 [ $ 225.00 [ $ 500.00 | $ 1,500.00
SKID STEER / LOADER ATTACHMENTS

Auger $ 51.00|$ 20340 | $ 597.00$ 12240 |$ 45120 ($ 1,27440| $ 101.00 | $ 302.00|$ 75800| $ 50.00| $ 100.00 |$ 200.00( $ 131.60| $ 309.14 [ $ 849.34
Auger bits <12” $ 2160|$ 6420|$ 150.00($ 5360 |% 19520($ 551.20|% 2900($ 90.00|$% 18700|% 50.00| $ 100.00 |$ 200.00($ 55.62| % 12195|$ 24282
Auger bits >12” $ 1740|$ 5160|$ 11580|$% 5360 |$ 19520 |$ 551.20| % 29.00|$% 90.00|$% 187.00|$ 50.00|$ 100.00|$ 200.00|$ 5562 % 121.95|$ 242.82
Grapple $ 1980|$ 7956|$ 239.04($ 8880 |% 32640 (% 92480| 3% 8400|$ 353.00|$ 733.00|$ 100.00 | $ 400.00 |$ 1,200.00($ 96.27 | $ 22036 |$ 39151
Fork $ 2460|$ 9840 |$ 26880($ 4160 |$ 15280 ($ 43280|$ 2500 |$ 77.00|$ 256.00| $ - $ - $ - $ 5562|$ 12195|$ 242.82
Landscape Rake / Harley Rake $ 135.00 | $ 495.00 [ $1,170.00 | $ 217.60 |$ 805.60 | $ 2,280.80 | $ 198.00 | $ 858.00 | $ 2,104.00| $ 150.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,800.00 [ $ 111.00 [ $ 291.00 | $ 794.00
Bucket Sweeper/Broom $ 105.00 | $ 36840 | $ 921.60($ 19440 |$ 71840 ($ 2,032.00| $ 202.00 | $ 660.00 |$ 1,60400| $ 125.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,500.00 [ $ 206.50 | $ 550.89 [ $ 1,652.68
Brush Cutter $ 126.00 | $ 504.00 | $1,500.00 [ $ 379.20 | $1,405.60 [ $ 3,973.60| $ 296.00 [ $ 887.00|$ 1,773.00| $ 13.00| $ 39.00|$ 117.00( NOBID NO BID NO BID
Snow Plow $ 45.00|$ 180.00| $ 540.00($ 71.20|$ 26320($ 73760| % 2800|($ 84.00|$ 16700|$ 115.00| $ 460.00 |$ 1,380.00( $ 69.53| $ 209.66 | $ 545.55
Stump Grinder $ 192.00 | $ 564.00 [ $1,680.00 | $ 228.00 |$ 84040 |$ 2,37360| $ 60.00|$ 180.00|$ 29500|$ 93.00|$ 372.00|$ 1,116.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trencher $ 132.00 | $ 462.00 | $1,290.00 [ $ 228.00 | $ 840.40 ($ 2,373.60 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 237.00 | $ 94800 |$ 2,844.00| $ 17500 | $ 575.00 | $ 1,390.00
Hoe -Pac NO BID NO BID NOBID [$ 193.60 |$ 716.00|$ 2,022.40 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 119.00 | $ 544.00 | $ 1,088.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydraulic Breaker, 350 ft. |b. NO BID NO BID NOBID [$ 176.80 |$ 65440 (% 1,848.00| $ 18400 | $ 646.00 | $ 1,399.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,650.00 [ $ 241.80 | $ 842.92 | $ 2,061.31
Hydraulic Breaker, 550 ft. Ib. NO BID NO BID NOBID [$ 252.00|$ 980.00($ 2,800.00| $ 184.00 | $ 646.00 | $ 1,399.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 585.00 | $ 1,755.00 [ $ 241.80 | $ 842.92 | $ 2,061.31
ELEVATED WORK PLATFORMS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
40 - 45', 4X4, articulated boom $ 288.00 | $ 816.00 | $1,950.00 [ $ 260.00 |$ 620.00 ($ 1,500.00 | $ 370.00 [ $ 929.00 | $ 1,999.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 575.00 | $ 1,350.00 [ $ 448.20 | $ 661.07 [ $ 1,983.22
150’, straight boom $1,500.00 | $3,774.00 | $9,432.00 | $1,800.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $2,330.00 | $6,304.00 | $ 14,779.00 | $2,250.00 | $9,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 [ $1,809.00 | $5,025.00 | $13,400.00
GENERATORS & PORTABLE LIGHTING DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
2.5 kw $ 72.00|$ 216.60 | $ 649.20|$ 39.00 |$ 137.00|$ 35500|% 2600|$% 97.00|$ 279.00|$ 2200|$ 8500|$ 250.00|$ 4172|$ 11018 |$ 268.49
3.5-4 kw $ 7200|$ 21660|$ 649.20($ 48.00|$ 16400($ 430.00|$ 3700|$ 144.00|$ 42300|$ 22.00|$ 8500|% 25000($ 46.00|$ 12195|$ 303.79
5-6kw $ 72.00|$ 21660|$ 649.20($ 65.00|$ 22000($ 57500| % 3700($ 144.00|$ 42300|% 32.00|$ 13500 |$ 33500($ 7595|% 20431 |$ 490.99
20 kw, silenced $ 10740 | $ 36840 |$ 921.60|$ 170.00 |$ 550.00 |$ 875.00|$ 133.00|$ 525.00|$ 1,098.00| $ 50.00| $ 200.00|$ 600.00 | $ 100.00 [ $ 300.00 | $ 900.00
20 kw, whisper $ 10740 | $ 36840 | $ 921.60($ 21840 |$ 819.20($ 1,440.00| $ 13300 | $ 525.00 |$ 1,098.00| $ 50.00| $ 200.00 |$ 600.00($ 100.00 | $ 300.00 [ $ 900.00
35 - 40 kw $ 2340|$ 9360|$ 268.80[$ 213.60|$ 793.60[$ 2,000.00| $ 149.00 (| $ 402.00|$ 916.00|$ 80.00| $ 320.00 |$ 900.00( $ 187.00 | $ 467.00 [ $ 1,400.00
45 - 50 kw $ 207.00 | $ 762.00 | $2,280.00 ($ 288.00 |$ 92160 ($ 2,611.20| $ 250.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 1,165.00| $ 170.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 2,000.00 [ $ 187.00 | $ 467.00 [ $ 1,400.00
60 kw, silenced $ 3840 | $ 15180 | $ 453.00| $ 420.00 |$ 995.20 | $ 2,408.00| $ 281.00| $ 757.00|$ 1,656.00| $ 18500 | $ 740.00 | $ 2,200.00 [ $ 260.00 [ $ 650.00 | $ 1,950.00
Flood Light, 1,000 / 1,500w $ 1560|$ 4680|$ 14040($ 60.00|$ 20500($ 47500| % 39.00($ 121.00|$ 26400|$ 1500|$ 6000 |$ 175.00($ 35.00| % 7500($ 200.00
30’ Telescoping Tower Light $ 2880 |$ 11520 $ 315.00|$ 180.00 |$ 400.00|$ 750.00| $ 127.00 | $ 403.00|$ 709.00| $ 100.00 | $ 300.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 277.10 [ $ 464.25 | $ 1,091.09
30’ Telescoping Tower Light, solar NO BID NO BID NOBID [$ 22160 |$ 812.00|$ 1,120.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 100.00 | $ 300.00|$ 600.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
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EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES

Cooper Equipment Battlefield Equipment United Rentals Sunbelt Rentals Hertz Equipment
LANDSCAPING DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
2-man Post hole Auger $ 4740 ([ $ 189.60 | $ 379.20 | $ 64.00 | $ 236.00 | $ 450.00 [ $ 65.00| $ 195.00 | $ 390.00 [ $ 60.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 720.00[ $ 55.00| $ 176.00 [ $ 459.00
1-man Post hole Hydraulic Auger $ 5880 [ % 23520| $ 675.00| $ 84.00 | $ 312.00 | $ 550.00 [ $ 105.00 | $ 395.00 | $ 645.00 ( $ 88.00| $ 352.00 |$ 1,056.00| $ 96.27 [ $ 215.01 | $ 578.71
4", towable Wood Chipper $ 90.00 | $ 264.00 | $ 780.00|$ 144.00 |$ 529.60 [$ 1,000.00 | $ 276.00 | $ 943.00 | $ 1,734.00 ( $ 132.00 | $ 528.00 | $ 1,584.00 | $ 185.00 [ $ 620.00 | $ 1,596.00
6", towable Wood Chipper $ 228.00 | $ 684.00 | $2,040.00 | $ 290.40 | $1,075.20 [ $ 2,400.00 | $ 276.00 | $ 943.00 | $ 1,734.00 [ $ 250.00 | $1,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 185.00 [ $ 620.00 | $ 1,596.00
9”, towable Wood Chipper NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 356.80 | $1,314.40 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 276.00 [ $ 943.00 | $ 1,734.00 | $ 395.00 | $1,580.00 [ $ 4,740.00 [ $ 414.00 | $ 881.43 | $ 2,313.75
12", towable Wood Chipper $ 300.00 | $1,140.00 | $3,600.00 | $ 451.20 | $1,674.40 [ $ 3,920.00 | $ 321.00 | $1,224.00 | $ 2,448.00 | $ 450.00 | $1,800.00 [ $ 5,400.00 | $ 414.00 | $ 881.43 | $ 2,313.75
Stump Grinder $ 66.00|$ 26400 | $ 765.00|$ 129.60 |$ 480.40($ 1,357.60| $ 118.00| $ 355.00 | $ 711.00 [ $ 357.00 | $1,393.00 | $ 2,785.00 | $ 137.00 [ $ 460.00 | $ 1,169.00
Ride on Trencher $ 132.00 [ $ 462.00 | $1,290.00 | $ 376.00 | $1,396.80 | $ 3,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 469.00 | $1,800.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 324.10 | $ 550.89 | $ 1,487.95
Walk Behind Trencher $ 10740 | $ 428.40 | $1,285.20 | $ 252.00 |$ 925.60 [ $ 2,000.00 | $ 78.00 | $ 234.00 | $ 469.00 [ $ 243.00 | $1,393.00 | $ 2,785.00 | $ 277.10 [ $ 550.89 | $ 1,652.68
Back Pack Blower $ 3840 | $ 13500 | $ 33780 | $ 52.80 |$ 190.40 | $ 539.20| $ 63.00| $ 213.00 [ $ 399.00| $ 28.00| $ 110.00 | $ 325.00| $ 41.72| $ 10483 | $ 358.35
Hand Held Blower $ 4740 ([ $ 165.00 | $ 41220 | $ 3280 |$ 116.80 | $ 328.00[ $ 63.00]| $ 213.00 | $ 399.00 [ $ 20.00| $ 80.00|$ 20000 [ $ 33.16|$ 93.06[$ 314.49
PUMPS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY [ 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
2" Submersible $ 1440|$ 5280 | $ 150.00|$ 20.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 16.00| $ 60.00 | $ 177.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 350.00 ($ 2781|$ 79.16|$ 22892
3” Submersible $ 24.00|$ 96.00 | $ 237.00]| % 40.00 [ $ 145.00 | $ 375.00 [ $ 42.00| $ 162.00 |$ 483.00| $ 57.00| $ 228.00 | $ 684.00($ 63.11|$ 121.95|$ 363.70
4" Submersible NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 98.40 [ $ 360.00 [ $ 1,016.80| $ 90.00| $ 373.00 | $ 857.00| $ 93.00| $ 372.00($ 1,116.00| $ 107.00 | $ 267.00 | $ 800.00
6" Submersible NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 23680 |$ 876.00|$ 2,478.40| $ 90.00( $ 373.00 | $ 857.00 [ $ 225.00| $ 575.00 |$ 1,400.00| $ 133.00 | $ 332.00 | $ 995.00
2" Centrifugal NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3440 | $ 124.00 | $ 351.20 [ $ 29.00| $ 112.00 | $ 321.00($ 41.00|$ 164.00 |$ 492.00|$ 4496 $ 104.83|$ 303.79
3" Centrifugal NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 48.80 | $ 179.20 | $ 504.00 [ $ 32.00| $ 128.00 | $ 386.00 (| $ 30.00| $ 120.00 | $ 250.00 [ $ 49.21|$ 13799 |$ 375.46
2" Trash Handling $ 2640 $ 10560 | $ 297.00 | $ 4320 | $ 163.20 |$ 456.80[ $ 29.00| $ 112.00 | $ 321.00 [ $ 25.00| $ 100.00 | $ 295.00 [ $ 39.00| $ 114.00 | $ 355.00
3" Trash Handling $ 2880 | $ 11520 | $ 345.00 | $ 5040 | $ 183.20 | $ 515.20 | $ 32.00| $ 128.00 [ $ 386.00 | $ 30.00| $ 120.00 [ $ 350.00 | $ 49.21| $ 13799 [ $ 375.46
4" Trash Handling $ 3960 | $ 154.20 | $ 450.60 | $ 72.00 | $ 266.40 | $ 74880 $ 90.00 | $ 373.00 | $ 857.00| $ 68.00| $ 222.00 [ $ 816.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4" Silenced Trash Handling $ 96.00 | $ 372.00 | $1,116.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 472.80 | $ 1,334.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 68.00$ 222.00$ 816.00 [ $ 355.00 | $ 887.00 | $ 2,660.00
6" Trash Handling $ 192.60 | $ 758.40 | $2,185.80 | $ 312.00 | $1,161.60 [ $ 3,28480| $ 172.00| $ 670.00 | $ 1,982.00 [ $ 264.00 | $1,056.00 | $ 3,168.00 | $ 367.00 [ $ 917.00 | $ 1,750.00
6" Silenced Trash Handling $ 385.80 | $1,285.80 | $3,771.60 | $ 566.40 | $2,102.40 [ $ 5950.40 | $ 172.00 | $ 670.00 | $ 1,982.00 [ $ 384.00 | $1,536.00 | $ 4,608.00 | $ 399.00 [ $ 998.00 | $ 2,995.00
8” Trash Handling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 465.00 | $1,550.00 | $ 4,650.00 [ $ 527.00 | $1,317.00 [ $ 3,950.00
8" Silenced Trash Handling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 550.00 | $2,200.00 [ $ 6,600.00 [ $ 630.00 | $1,575.00 | $ 4,725.00
12" Trash Handling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 875.00 | $3,500.00 | $10,500.00 [ $ 900.00 | $2,500.00 [ $ 7,500.00
12" Silenced Trash Handling NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 | $4,000.00 | $12,000.00 [ $ 733.00 | $1,883.00 [ $ 5,500.00
INTAKE EXTENSION HOSES
2" x 20' Rigid $ 6.00 [ $ 16.20| $ 36.60]|$ 6.40 | $ 28.80 | $ 84.80 | $ 500($ 16.00|$ 37.00 | $ 9.00 NO BID NO BID $ 9.00( $ 16.00 | $ 46.00
3" x 20' Rigid $ 840 [ $ 2340|$ 5160 $ 9.60 | $ 38.40 | $ 116.80 | $ 800($ 2500]|$ 60.00 | $ 11.00 NO BID NO BID $ 11.00| $ 30.00| $ 68.00
4" x 20" Rigid $ 1440($ 3960 |$ 89.40|$% 12.80 | $ 53.60 | $ 159.20| $ 1100 $ 32.00|$ 70.00 | $ 14.00 NO BID NO BID $ 11.00($ 3000 $ 68.00
6" x 20' Rigid $ 2040|$ 5580 |$ 12540 % 18.40 | $ 67.20 | $ 201.60($ 13.00|$ 38.00|$% 81.00| $ 27.00 NO BID NO BID $ 16.00( $ 40.00| $ 100.00
8" x 20' Rigid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 73.00 NO BID NO BID $ 22.00|$ 54.00|$ 135.00
12" x 20" Rigid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 123.00 NO BID NO BID $ 22.00|$% 54.00|$ 135.00
DISCHARGE HOSES
2" x 50' Layflat $ 585[(% 1560 | $ 33.60]|$% 640 | $ 28.80 | $ 84.80 | $ 500($ 2100]|$ 55.00 | $ 500($ 20.00]|$ 50.00| $ 1177 $ 16.05|$ 34.23
3" x 50' Layflat $ 840 | $ 2340 |$ 51.60]|$ 9.60 | $ 38.40 | $ 116.80 | $ 7.00|$ 29.00|$ 70.00| $ 11.00|$ 44.00|$ 13200 | $ 1391 |$ 2032 | $ 48.14
4" x 50" Layflat $ 1440|$ 3960 | $ 89.40]|% 12.80 | $ 53.60 | $ 159.20 | $ 11.00 | $ 42.00|$ 97.00| $ 16.00|$ 64.00|$ 192.00| $ 16.00 | $ 40.00($ 100.00
6" x 25' Layflat $ 2040|$ 5580 |$ 12540]| % 18.40 | $ 67.20 | $ 20160 $ 17.00| $ 69.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 17.00[ $ 68.00| $ 20400 ($ 16.00| $ 40.00|$ 100.00
8" x 25' Layflat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2400|$ 7100 $ 185.00 | $ 36.00 [ $ 90.00 | $ 225.00
12" x 25' Layflat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 14.00| $ 55.00 % 221.00[$ 36.00| $ 90.00($ 225.00
8" x 10' Rigid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2400|$% 71.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 22.00| $ 54.00($ 135.00
12" x 10" Rigid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 21.00| $ 83.00|$ 333.00($ 22.00|$ 54.00|$ 135.00
MISCELLANEOUS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY [ 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS DAILY WEEKLY | 4 WEEKS
Pop-up Spill Containment NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 49.00 | $ 147.00 | $ 294.00 | $ 700($ 2300]|% 68.00| $ 2400 $ 60.00|$ 150.00
Fuel Cube, 1000 Litres $ 57.00[$ 228.00| $ 390.00 NO BID $ 20080 ($ 460.00| $ 99.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 489.00| $ 125.00( $ 313.00 | $ 500.00 [ $ 51.00| $ 128.00 [ $ 320.00
Fuel Cube, 2000 Litres $ 63.00 [ $ 252.00 | $ 468.00 NO BID $ 401.60 | $ 920.00 [ $ 200.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 900.00 [ $ 161.00 | $ 803.00 [ $ 2,483.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Propane Tank (for Trailers), 100 Ibs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.00 [ $ 2.00 [ $ 2.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Installation of Propane Tank, 100 Ibs NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID
Price to Re-Fuel Tank, 100 Ibs NO BID $ 67.00 NO BID NO BID
FREIGHT
Delivery charge for small equipment $ 35.00 $  35.00 $ 115.00 $ 20.00 $  65.00
Delivery charge for small roll off equipment $ 75.00 $  95.00 $ 115.00 $ 75.00 $ 95.00
Delivery charge for larger roll off equipment $ 105.00 $ 175.00 $ 115.00 $ 125.00 $ 125.00
Float charge $ 175.00 $ 250.00 $ 115.00 $ 190.00 $ 200.00




